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The book is a complete lab guide for SQL Server. It consists of 
two parts, of which the first part deals with the database 
subject, while the second part deals with the subject of 
Warehousing and Data Mining. The first part of the book 
describes the basic functions and capabilities offered by a 
database management system. Specifically, it describes the 
features of SQL Server 2014 Management Studio in five 
chapters. SQL Server is a powerful tool that contains a 
multitude of capabilities, including Data Definition Language 
commands, Data Manipulation Language commands, and the 
Transact-SQL programming language for creating

stored procedures, triggers, and transactions. Each of the five 
chapters in the first part of the book describes one of these 
SQL Server features in detail. The second part of the book 
describes basic data mining techniques and the process of 
creating cubes in data warehouses. The second part of the 
book describes these techniques through the use of SQL 
Server 2014 Business Intelligence. Specifically, the five 
chapters in the second part describe mining techniques such 
as decision trees, clustering, association rules, and time series. 
Finally, data warehouses are discussed in the last chapter of 
the book.
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